
D i  sposi t i  on: P 
To: J .ROBERTSON (DOE1217) 
To: C.LUSHBAUGH (DOE1258) 
To: C.EDINGTON (DOE6051 
To: J .THIESSEN (DOE6701 

From: C.LUSHBAUGH (DOE12581 Posted: Tue 28-Aug-84 11:04 EDT Sys 64 

Subject :  Y O U R  AUGUST 27 MESSAGE AND QUESTIONS 

Joop: 

I a p p r e c i a t e  your prompt reply confirming t h a t  OHER will  provide 
$30,000 in FY 1985 f o r  our medical a s s i s t a n c e  t o  the Mexican r a d i a t i o n  
accident .  T h i s  i s  the  "addi t iona l  f i n a n c i a l  support" I requested i n  my 
message, Monday, 17 August 1984. 

There i s  no objec t ion  t o  your passing on the a t tached  information 
about the Casablanca acc ident  as long as  i t  i s  t r e a t e d  "adminis t ra t ive ly  
sensitive'' o r  "Off ic ia l  Use Only" so  t h a t  i t s  source i s  p ro tec ted .  

Yes, I am i n  communication w i t h  Dr.H. Jammet, D i r e c t o r ,  WHO I n t e r -  
nat ional  Centre f o r  Radiation Pathology (Europe) because of my d e s i g n a t i o  
a s  D i r e c t o r ,  WHO, I n t e r n a t i o n a l  Center of Radiat ion Pathology (Western 
Hemisphere) , a p a r t  of OHER'S REAC/TS Program. 

I need you t o  know, WHO/IAEA provides  no f i n a n c i a l  support  t o  these 

PAHO/WHO has  paid only the c o s t  
programs unless  a reques t  f o r  a s s i s t a n c e  comes t o  them i n  an emergency 
from a fore ign  government member of U N .  
of Dr. Hubner's f i r s t  t r i p  t o  Juarez ,  whereas OHER/REAC/TS has now 
supported one t r ip  by Hubner t o  Mexico C i t y  and one by me t o  Juarez  since 
Hubner '  s res igna t ion .  

L u s h  

Dispos i t ion :  

Disposi t ion:  

To: C.LUSHBAUGH (DOE12581 
Cc: J .ROBERTSON (DOE12171 704715 
Cc: C.EDINGTON (DOE605) 
Cc : J .THIESSEN (DOE670 1 

From: J.THIESSEN (DOE6701 Posted: Mon 27-Aug-84 16:47 E D T  Sys 64 ( 9 )  
Subject :  Your msg t o  C.W.Edington 

subject: REAC/TS - Moroccan Accident, please be advised t h a t  the i n i t i a l  

Mexican accident  medical ass i s tance .  Let  me know i f  th i s  covers  the 
"addi t iona l  f i n a n c i a l  support" t h a t  you mention i n  th i s  message. 

I s  t h e r e  any objec t ion  t o  pass  on the  at tached information t o  
Dr .Tr ive lp iece ' s  o f f i c e ?  

Lush :  W i t h  r e s p e c t  t o  your message of today, 15:36, by e l e c t r o n i c  mail ,  r 

0 guidance f o r  FY 85 w i l l  provide you w i t h  $ 30,000 of c o s t  f o r  coverage of the 

Do you have any communication w i t h  Jammet? 
j oop 
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To: M.MINTHORN (DOE1216) 
To: J .ROBERTSON (DOE1217) 
To: R.WO0D (DOE12181 
To: H.MCCAMMON (DOE12191 

From: C.EDINGTON (DOE6051 Posted: Fri 31-Aug-84 13:58 EDT Sys 64 ( 2 )  


